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Abstract 
This paper gives an overview of the product development process applied to developmenl of 
code-marking equipmenl for logs. The leaming and decision making process Juring lhe 
development is showed. Also the situations when a decision had to be made without having 
sufficient amount of infonnation are described. The development of a log code-marking 
equipment for a log sorting station in a sawmill is described retrospectively. but the 
development of a code-marker for harvester mounting is described as in real lime. In the latter 
case the conditions for code-marking on-board forest machines are discussed and different 
possible solutions are described and evaluated but thc final dccision is left open. So it is 
possible for every reader to make his own decision. 
This product development process shows that in a specific case it is not only difficult to 
generate good concepts, it is also difficult to decide, evaluate and guess whether the concept 
is viable, would it work in a real environment and is it robust enough? This question appears 
especially when the product will be created in the field where no solution exists. Finally it is 
concluded lhat in this product development process the discovery of new ideas in concept 
generation is strongly motivated by the need for them, when it is realised that the available 
concepts/solutions do not work, then there exists much stronger motivation for finding new 
concepts. This is an iterative process, with several loops. 

Introduction 
The saw milling industry has a big role in the Nordic countries and all kinds of enhancing and 
rationalisation, which can decrease the production costs, are always welcome. One possible 
way is to achieve better control of the process and infonnation plays the key role in 
maintaining control. The traceability technique and communication through a code-mark on 
logs is one possible tool for monitoring and information transferring. Code-marking can be 
done in a log sorting station in a sawmill mostly for automatic control of sawmill production 
equipment or in the forest by a harvester for identity or property marking. The first practical 
study on code-marking of logs was carried out during the Nordic project "Sparbarhet" 
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